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From: Ernest Wong <ernestwong@|

Sent: Thursday, September 25, 2014 10:25 AM
To: Dominic Sin

Cc Kenrick Cheah (Kenrick@ ||| G
Subject: RE: Chris Minns raffle money

Dominic

Since this money will go to Chris campaign, if you donation to chris has not gone over $2200, can you sign the form
that you are the donor of that amount of money. Thanks

W armest ﬁcyar/

Hon. Ernest Wong
Member of NSW Legislative Council

New South Wales Parliament House
Macquarie Street Sydney NSW 2000
Phone!

Fax:

From: Dominic Sin

Sent: Wednesday, 24 September 2014 6:28 PM
To: 'Kenrick Cheah'; Ernest Wong

Subject: RE: Chris Minns raffle money

How best to do that? Advice ?

From: Kenrick Cheah

Sent: Wednesday, 24 September 2014 6:07 PM
To: Ernest Wong; Dominic Sin

Subject: Chris Minns raffle money

Hey guys

Just a reminder that there is still $725 worth of cash from the Minns raffle at the Chinese fundraiser that someone/s
needs to account for with a signed form please.

Also, | have confirmed with our finance team that Sunnys Harbour Restaurant was paid on the 18th Sep (last week)
Thanks!

Kenrick

Kenrick Cheah
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